
RETURN TO WORK MENTAL HEALTH WORKERS 

COMPENSATION

HEALTH, SAFETY  

AND WELLBEING

*Access all courses for free with the exception of Mental Health First Aid - however customers still receive a substantial discount for this course only paying $300 instead of the $450 full price. 

1st Quarter, 2024 Facilitated Employer Training Events – Launching January 8th

• Complex Case Management –
Return to work planning

• Effectively utilising health 
professionals to improve Return-to-
Work outcomes (Work Rehab) 

• Role of the Return-to-Work 
Coordinator – VIC (Workplace 
Interventions) 

• Psychosocial factors at work (HSE 
Global)

• Readiness for psychosocial risk 
management (FlourishDX) 

• When the psychosocial Inspector 
calls (FlourishDX) 

• Understanding and preventing 
secondary psychological injuries 
(Work Rehab) 

• Psychological claims-
Understanding diagnosis (Need a 
Psych?) 

• Mental Health First Aid (NSW) 

• Supporting workers subject to 
vicarious trauma (Work Rehab) 

• Introduction to workers 
compensation and injury 
management - South Australia (HSE 
Global) 

• Introduction to workers 
compensation and injury 
management - Victoria (HSE 
Global) 

• Workers' compensation national 
updates and insights

• Complex case management –
Dispute management 

• Managing non-work-related 
Injuries in the workplace (PHSA)

• Understanding common injuries 

• EMlearning Masterclass –
Introduction to Absorb 

Face to Face       Virtual        Both
REGISTER TODAY

For full event details and to book your
ticket visit eml.com.au/training

In addition to our in-house experts, in 2024 our program will include presenters from industry leaders  
such as HSE Global, FlourishDX, Workplace Interventions, Work Rehab, PHSA and Need a Psych?.
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